
 

JANUARY FEBRUARY MARCH APRIL MAY JUNE 
Area cookie rally 
Cookie sale begins 
 
 
 
 
SC: Distribute Cookie 
Fact Sheets and Summer 
Camp information to the 
school/Community table. 

World Thinking Day 22nd  
Rising K – Registration 
 
 
 
 
 
SC: Attend Kindergarten 
Registration and host a 
recruitment table to 
collect interest cards. 

Girl Scout Week 
Cookie sale ends 
Rising K – Registration 
 
SC: Approach school 
administration to plan a 
“wear your uniform” day 
at the school in 
celebration of Girl Scout 
Week. Share promotion 
with girls in troops at the 
school; ask NTDD. 

Volunteer Appreciation 
Month 
Rising K – Registration 
 
 
SC: Ask permission to set 
up a bulletin board 
display of cool GS things 
the Scouts at the school 
have done! Or spotlight 
an awesome volunteer 
who’s daughter goes 
there! 

Community Service 
Project  
Girl Scout Bridging 
Ceremonies  
 
 
SC: Thank the school 
administration for the 
support of GS with a 
note and maybe even 
cookies! 

Girl Scout Bridging 
Ceremonies  
Summer Resident Camp 
begins 
 
 
SC: Work with MD to 
gather supplies and 
prepare for school open 
houses in July & August.  
Review school calendar 
of events and identify 
open house nights. 

JULY AUGUST SEPTEMBER OCTOBER NOVEMBER DECEMBER 
Open House at school 
Summer Resident Camp 
Area event for rising 
Daisies 
 
SC: Attend school open 
house and host a 
recruitment table – 
invite to local area 
events or troop 
meetings. Introduce 
yourself to the Principal. 
 
 

Open House at school 
Summer Resident Camp 
ends 
Fall Recruitment 
 
SC: Attend school open 
house and host a 
recruitment table – 
invite to local area 
events or troop 
meetings.  Introduce 
yourself to the Principal 
 

Fall Recruitment  
 
 
 
 
SC: Assist MD with 
stacking and distribution 
of recruitment flyers.  
Ask school 
administration about 
troop meeting or 
upcoming event space.  

Fall Product sale begins 
Juliette Gordon Low’s 
Birthday 31st 

 

 

SC: Set up a table to 
collect interest cards at 
Fall Festival, Curriculum 
Night or Book Fair. 

Fall Product sale ends 
 
 
 
 
SC: Schedule time to 
attend a PTA meeting to 
give the elevator speech 
about GS; can partner 
with the MD.  

Cookie sale training 
Community Service 
Project 
 
 
SC: Ask permission to 
share information about 
available troops or an 
upcoming event to the 
school Facebook page, 
calendar or parent email. 

 


